
 
 
 

 

 
 

 
 
H11 - CENTRAL BALANCE  
2 or 3 hands 
 
The H11 - Central Balance is the first 
timepiece with the balance at the center of the 
movement, with the hour and minute display 
maintaining their traditional position in the 
center. 
More beautiful than any other Haldimann 
timepiece before, the H11 shows two facets of 
time: the measured time and the flow of time.  
 
Fully designed and manufactured by 
HALDIMANN HOROLOGY. 
Balance on bridge side in the center of the 
movement. H and min hands centrally 
positioned. Available with a small seconds 
indicator. Handcrafted case, concave 
Haldimann side finish. Case diameter: 37.0 
mm, 39.0 mm, or 41.0 mm. Thickness: 10.8 mm. 
Domed double-coated anti-reflective sapphire 
crystal. Sapphire crystal case back. Water 
resistance: 30 m / 3 bar. Alligator leather strap 
with Haldimann stamp. Size 20/18. Other 
materials upon request. Case and folding 
clasp: Yellow gold, rose gold, white gold, steel, 
or platinum with Haldimann hallmark. Hand-
turned box crafted in Thun/Switzerland from 
the noble wood of the walnut tree. 
 
CALIBER 
 
ZEN-H11/ 2 hands 
ZEN-H11/ 3 hands 
 
Manual winding and hand setting via crown. 
Diameter: 31.58 mm. Height: 3.70 mm. 
Number of parts in movement: 161 (with 
seconds indicator 168). Rubies: 19. Power 
reserve: 38 hours. Balance: Glucydur screw 
balance. Shock absorber: Haldi-Bloc. Spiral: 
Flat balance spring. Frequency: 21,600 vph (3 
Hz). 
 
 
CONTACT	 
HALDIMANN	HOROLOGY	•	Villa	Nussbühl	•	Riedstrasse	2	•	CH-3600	
Thun	•	Switzerland	•	info@haldimann.swiss	•	www.haldimann.swiss 
 

 


